
 

 
 

 
Organization:    CAN-DO.org 

   
 Date Founded:   September 2004  
   

Description:     CAN-DO (Compassion into Action Network – Direct 
Outcome Organization) provides grassroots relief in 
emergency situations. Video, photographs and the CAN-
DO website offer documentation of the organization’s 
efforts every step of the way. CAN-DO does not get 
involved in the bureaucracy and greed that only cripples 
progress and interferes with the wellbeing of those 
whose lives are impacted by disaster. The organization 
works with all groups regardless of religious affiliation. 
CAN-DO’s overall mission is to provide straight forward 
relief with 100% accountability and zero red tape. 

 
Partner Network:     In addition to CAN-DO’s “direct-impact” grassroots relief, 

the organization also offers a Virtual Volunteer Program, 
which allows individuals and businesses to choose a 
project that’s important to them and donate, track 
progress online. It is the first interactive website that 
enables individuals, donors, corporations and 
organizations to participate virtually in live humanitarian 
projects and critical disaster zones. To become part of 
the CAN-DO Network your group or organization must 
be ethical, transparent and accountable. To get started, 
contact us via email or post your projects on CAN-DO’s 
Virtual Volunteer site for review, consideration. 

 
Donors/Sponsors:     CAN-DO invites monetary donations from individuals, 

businesses and other organizations. Donations can be 
made on the CAN-DO and Virtual Volunteer websites. 
Donors can specify to which project they would like to 
donate. CAN-DO also invites goods and services from 
corporate sponsors but only those that meet the specific 
needs of the people and communities we are trying to 
help. We are looking to partner with other corporate 
sponsors that can be on standby for relief projects. A list 
of projects and supporters is on the CAN-DO website. 

 
 Executives:    Eric Klein – Founder & CEO 
     Cosmo Pfeil - Director of Operations, East Coast 
     Bob Putnam - Director of Operations, Gulf Coast  
     Brett Perrine - Vice President of Sales & Marketing 
     Erik Summers – Secretary & Web Administration   

      
 Contact Information:   578 Washington Blvd. Ste. 390 
     Marina Del Rey, CA 90292 
     Phone: (877) CAN-DO97 (226-3697) 
     Email: administration@can-do.org 

 
  Organization Website:  www.can-do.org  
 

 Partner Network Site:    http://virtualvolunteer.tv  


